
Timber Auction Results
February 15, 2024

Tract Contract Round
Offered

Round 
Sold

Bidder Appraised 
Price

Bidup Sold Price Down 
Payment

1 C19240001 Boise White Paper 
LLC

$21,621.17 75% $37,795.00 $3,243.18

2 C19240002 No Bid $1,752.50

3 C19240003 Boise White Paper 
LLC

$11,565.23 43% $16,565.00 $1,734.78

4 C19240004 L & L 
Constructors

$75,181.74 38% $103,997.52 $11,277.26

5 C19240005 L & L 
Constructors

$26,663.77 10% $29,297.77 $3,999.57

6 C19240006 L & L 
Constructors

$71,589.71 49% $106,559.84 $10,738.46

7 C19240007 Sappi Fine Paper $6,382.27 15% $7,323.40 $957.34

8 C19240008 No Bid $16,649.47

9 C19240009 No Bid $11,458.09

10 C19240010 Island Lake 
Logging

$41,003.26 31% $53,773.50 $6,150.49

11 C19240011 Island Lake 
Logging

$61,114.23 59% $97,017.00 $9,167.13

12 C19240012 Jatco Inc. $67,842.67 87% $126,775.96 $10,176.40

13 C19240013 Island Lake 
Logging

$25,928.76 92% $49,683.00 $3,889.31

14 C19240014 Tristate Logging $10,881.00 52% $16,536.00 $1,632.15

15 C19240015 No Bid $10,817.16

16 C19240016 Tristate Logging $5,023.00 85% $9,298.00 $753.45

17 C19240017 Tristate Logging $381.00 22% $466.00 $57.15

18 C19240018 Nels Kimball $10,948.60 11% $12,114.60 $1,642.29

19 C19240019 Lobb Forest 
Enterprises LLC

$37,385.74 29% $48,158.20 $5,607.86

20 C19240020 Tristate Logging $1,890.00 33% $2,520.00 $283.50

21 C19240021 Watters 
Excavating 

$25,254.72 100% $50,494.00 $3,788.21

22 C19240022 Watters 
Excavating 

$28,251.16 108% $58,688.00 $4,237.67

23 C19240023 Watters 
Excavating 

$29,012.12 121% $64,170.00 $4,351.82

24 C19240024 Watters 
Excavating 

$21,998.41 99% $43,756.50 $3,299.76

25 C19240025 Watters 
Excavating 

$40,833.07 143% $99,128.00 $6,124.96

26 C19240026 No Bid $845.00

27 C19240027 No Bid $1,905.00

28 C19240028 Watters 
Excavating 

$77,455.27 132% $179,946.00 $11,618.29

29 C19240029 Futurewood 
Corporation

$47,234.58 55% $73,260.00 $7,085.19

30 C19240030 Tristate Logging $3,428.81 5% $3,615.00 $514.32

Sealed Bid Auction



Tract Contract Round
Offered

Round 
Sold

Bidder Appraised 
Price

Bidup Sold Price Down 
Payment

31 C19240031 Watters 
Excavating 

$26,798.07 96% $52,440.50 $4,019.71

32 C19240032 Island Lake 
Logging

$10,556.08 95% $20,587.50 $1,583.41

33 C19240033 Watters 
Excavating 

$107,256.52 115% $230,914.50 $16,088.48

34 C19240034 Watters 
Excavating 

$36,912.80 79% $66,178.00 $5,536.92

35 C19240035 Tristate Logging $15,758.94 45% $22,861.00 $2,363.84

Total Offered: $989,579.92

Average Bid up: 66%

Total: $946,152.70 $1,683,919.79 $141,922.91



Sealed Bid Results Detail
February 15, 2024

Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 1 C19240001

Boise White Paper LLC
ASPEN 26.38 40.00 508.00 Cds $20,320.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 10.00 29.00 Cds $290.00
BIRCH 7.03 10.00 8.00 Cds $80.00

PINE-JACK 16.14 32.00 260.00 Cds $8,320.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 35.00 251.00 Cds $8,785.00

$37,795.00 *Winner*

Greg Cook Logging
ASPEN 26.38 34.00 508.00 Cds $17,272.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 18.00 29.00 Cds $522.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 8.00 Cds $120.00

PINE-JACK 16.14 35.00 260.00 Cds $9,100.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 40.00 251.00 Cds $10,040.00

$37,054.00  

Scheff Logging & Trucking
ASPEN 26.38 32.50 508.00 Cds $16,510.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 11.00 29.00 Cds $319.00
BIRCH 7.03 10.00 8.00 Cds $80.00

PINE-JACK 16.14 25.50 260.00 Cds $6,630.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 21.75 251.00 Cds $5,459.25

$28,998.25  

Sunne Logging
ASPEN 26.38 36.00 508.00 Cds $18,288.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 10.80 29.00 Cds $313.20
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 8.00 Cds $56.24

PINE-JACK 16.14 20.00 260.00 Cds $5,200.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 20.00 251.00 Cds $5,020.00

$28,877.44  

UPM Blandin Forestry
ASPEN 26.38 40.00 508.00 Cds $20,320.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 10.00 29.00 Cds $290.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BIRCH 7.03 12.00 8.00 Cds $96.00
PINE-JACK 16.14 30.50 260.00 Cds $7,930.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 30.35 251.00 Cds $7,617.85
$36,253.85  

Tract 3 C19240003

Boise White Paper LLC
ASPEN 26.38 38.00 403.00 Cds $15,314.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 38.00 15.00 Cds $570.00
BALSAM FIR 8.80 9.00 25.00 Cds $225.00

BIRCH 7.03 8.00 18.00 Cds $144.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 8.00 4.00 Cds $32.00

PINE-JACK 16.14 20.00 4.00 Cds $80.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 20.00 10.00 Cds $200.00

$16,565.00 *Winner*

L & L Constructors
ASPEN 26.38 30.38 403.00 Cds $12,243.14

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 23.67 15.00 Cds $355.05
BALSAM FIR 8.80 8.80 25.00 Cds $220.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 18.00 Cds $126.54
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 4.00 Cds $20.04

PINE-JACK 16.14 16.14 4.00 Cds $64.56
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 10.00 Cds $147.90

$13,177.23  

Tract 4 C19240004

L & L Constructors
ASH 6.00 6.00 5.00 Cds $30.00

ASPEN 31.66 47.80 1027.00 Cds $49,090.60
BALSAM FIR 10.56 10.56 3.00 Cds $31.68

BIRCH 8.44 8.44 55.00 Cds $464.20
MAPLE-RED 6.01 6.01 8.00 Cds $48.08

PINE-JACK 19.37 19.37 13.00 Cds $251.81
PINE-NORWAY 35.00 45.00 144.00 Cds $6,480.00

PINE-WHITE 33.73 43.73 1080.00 Cds $47,228.40
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 17.75 21.00 Cds $372.75

$103,997.52 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Boise White Paper LLC
ASH 6.00 6.00 5.00 Cds $30.00

ASPEN 31.66 41.00 1027.00 Cds $42,107.00
BALSAM FIR 10.56 11.00 3.00 Cds $33.00

BIRCH 8.44 11.00 55.00 Cds $605.00
MAPLE-RED 6.01 11.00 8.00 Cds $88.00

PINE-JACK 19.37 35.00 13.00 Cds $455.00
PINE-NORWAY 35.00 47.50 144.00 Cds $6,840.00

PINE-WHITE 33.73 47.50 1080.00 Cds $51,300.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 35.00 21.00 Cds $735.00

$102,193.00  

Tract 5 C19240005

L & L Constructors
ASPEN 26.38 32.38 439.00 Cds $14,214.82

BALSAM FIR 8.80 8.80 390.00 Cds $3,432.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 46.00 Cds $323.38

MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 206.00 Cds $1,032.06
PINE-JACK 16.14 16.14 3.00 Cds $48.42

PINE-NORWAY 29.16 29.16 198.00 Cds $5,773.68
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 16.42 104.00 Cds $1,707.68
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 187.00 Cds $2,765.73

$29,297.77 *Winner*

Tract 6 C19240006

L & L Constructors
ASH 5.50 5.50 63.00 Cds $346.50

ASPEN 29.02 45.01 2187.00 Cds $98,436.87
BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 26.03 15.00 Cds $390.45

BALSAM FIR 9.68 9.68 252.00 Cds $2,439.36
BIRCH 7.74 7.74 243.00 Cds $1,880.82

MAPLE-RED 5.51 5.51 234.00 Cds $1,289.34
MAPLE-SUGAR 7.51 7.51 43.00 Cds $322.93

PINE-JACK 17.75 17.75 21.00 Cds $372.75
SPRUCE-BLACK 18.06 18.06 13.00 Cds $234.78
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 16.27 52.00 Cds $846.04

$106,559.84 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Boise White Paper LLC
ASH 5.50 5.50 63.00 Cds $346.50

ASPEN 29.02 43.00 2187.00 Cds $94,041.00
BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 43.00 15.00 Cds $645.00

BALSAM FIR 9.68 10.00 252.00 Cds $2,520.00
BIRCH 7.74 8.00 243.00 Cds $1,944.00

MAPLE-RED 5.51 8.00 234.00 Cds $1,872.00
MAPLE-SUGAR 7.51 8.00 43.00 Cds $344.00

PINE-JACK 17.75 25.00 21.00 Cds $525.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 18.06 25.00 13.00 Cds $325.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 25.00 52.00 Cds $1,300.00

$103,862.50  

Tract 7 C19240007

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN 21.10 21.10 294.00 Cds $6,203.40

BALSAM FIR 7.04 35.00 4.00 Cds $140.00
BIRCH 5.63 35.00 17.00 Cds $595.00

MAPLE-RED 5.00 35.00 11.00 Cds $385.00
$7,323.40 *Winner*

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 21.10 23.50 294.00 Cds $6,909.00

BALSAM FIR 7.04 7.50 4.00 Cds $30.00
BIRCH 5.63 6.00 17.00 Cds $102.00

MAPLE-RED 5.00 6.00 11.00 Cds $66.00
$7,107.00  

Tract 
10

C19240010

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 29.02 35.50 1197.00 Cds $42,493.50

BALSAM FIR 9.68 15.00 281.00 Cds $4,215.00
BIRCH 7.74 15.00 293.00 Cds $4,395.00

MAPLE-RED 5.51 15.00 108.00 Cds $1,620.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 25.00 42.00 Cds $1,050.00

$53,773.50 *Winner*

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN 29.02 31.10 1197.00 Cds $37,226.70



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 9.68 9.68 281.00 Cds $2,720.08
BIRCH 7.74 7.74 293.00 Cds $2,267.82

MAPLE-RED 5.51 5.51 108.00 Cds $595.08
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 16.27 42.00 Cds $683.34

$43,493.02  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 29.02 32.00 1197.00 Cds $38,304.00

BALSAM FIR 9.68 10.00 281.00 Cds $2,810.00
BIRCH 7.74 8.00 293.00 Cds $2,344.00

MAPLE-RED 5.51 6.00 108.00 Cds $648.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 17.00 42.00 Cds $714.00

$44,820.00  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 29.02 32.52 1197.00 Cds $38,926.44

BALSAM FIR 9.68 9.68 281.00 Cds $2,720.08
BIRCH 7.74 7.74 293.00 Cds $2,267.82

MAPLE-RED 5.51 5.51 108.00 Cds $595.08
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 16.27 42.00 Cds $683.34

$45,192.76  

Tract 
11

C19240011

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 29.02 46.00 1914.00 Cds $88,044.00

BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 46.00 3.00 Cds $138.00
BALSAM FIR 9.68 15.00 93.00 Cds $1,395.00

BIRCH 7.74 15.00 173.00 Cds $2,595.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 18.06 25.00 55.00 Cds $1,375.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 25.00 138.00 Cds $3,450.00

TAMARACK 3.51 5.00 4.00 Cds $20.00
$97,017.00 *Winner*

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN 29.02 45.28 1914.00 Cds $86,665.92

BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 45.28 3.00 Cds $135.84
BALSAM FIR 9.68 9.68 93.00 Cds $900.24

BIRCH 7.74 7.74 173.00 Cds $1,339.02
SPRUCE-BLACK 18.06 18.25 55.00 Cds $1,003.75
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 18.25 138.00 Cds $2,518.50



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

TAMARACK 3.51 3.51 4.00 Cds $14.04
$92,577.31  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 29.02 34.00 1914.00 Cds $65,076.00

BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 34.00 3.00 Cds $102.00
BALSAM FIR 9.68 10.00 93.00 Cds $930.00

BIRCH 7.74 8.00 173.00 Cds $1,384.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 18.06 19.00 55.00 Cds $1,045.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 19.00 138.00 Cds $2,622.00

TAMARACK 3.51 4.00 4.00 Cds $16.00
$71,175.00  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 29.02 32.52 1914.00 Cds $62,243.28

BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 30.00 3.00 Cds $90.00
BALSAM FIR 9.68 9.68 93.00 Cds $900.24

BIRCH 7.74 7.74 173.00 Cds $1,339.02
SPRUCE-BLACK 18.06 18.06 55.00 Cds $993.30
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 16.27 138.00 Cds $2,245.26

TAMARACK 3.51 3.51 4.00 Cds $14.04
$67,825.14  

Tract 
12

C19240012

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN 26.38 49.75 901.00 Cds $44,824.75

BALSAM FIR 8.80 8.80 42.00 Cds $369.60
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 98.00 Cds $688.94

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 49.00 Cds $245.49

PINE-JACK 16.14 16.14 17.00 Cds $274.38
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 55.50 1438.00 Cds $79,809.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 28.10 9.00 Cds $252.90
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 16.42 3.00 Cds $49.26
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 16.00 Cds $236.64

$126,775.96 *Winner*

Bell Timber, Inc.
ASPEN 26.38 40.63 901.00 Cds $36,607.63



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 8.80 8.80 42.00 Cds $369.60
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 98.00 Cds $688.94

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 49.00 Cds $245.49

PINE-JACK 16.14 24.86 17.00 Cds $422.62
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 44.91 1438.00 Cds $64,580.58

PINE-WHITE 28.10 43.27 9.00 Cds $389.43
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 16.42 3.00 Cds $49.26
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 16.00 Cds $236.64

$103,615.19  

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 26.38 42.00 901.00 Cds $37,842.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 9.00 42.00 Cds $378.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.05 98.00 Cds $690.90

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.25 49.00 Cds $257.25

PINE-JACK 16.14 16.25 17.00 Cds $276.25
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 40.00 1438.00 Cds $57,520.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 30.00 9.00 Cds $270.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 18.00 3.00 Cds $54.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 18.00 16.00 Cds $288.00

$97,601.40  

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc
ASPEN 26.38 28.00 901.00 Cds $25,228.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 8.80 42.00 Cds $369.60
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 98.00 Cds $688.94

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 49.00 Cds $245.49

PINE-JACK 16.14 16.14 17.00 Cds $274.38
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 42.75 1438.00 Cds $61,474.50

PINE-WHITE 28.10 28.10 9.00 Cds $252.90
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 16.42 3.00 Cds $49.26
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 16.00 Cds $236.64

$88,844.71  

Hull Forest Products
ASPEN 26.38 35.00 901.00 Cds $31,535.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 8.80 42.00 Cds $369.60
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 98.00 Cds $688.94



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 49.00 Cds $245.49

PINE-JACK 16.14 16.14 17.00 Cds $274.38
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 45.00 1438.00 Cds $64,710.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 28.10 9.00 Cds $252.90
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 16.42 3.00 Cds $49.26
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 16.00 Cds $236.64

$98,387.21  

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 26.38 46.00 901.00 Cds $41,446.00

BALSAM FIR 8.80 15.00 42.00 Cds $630.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 98.00 Cds $1,470.00

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 49.00 Cds $735.00

PINE-JACK 16.14 25.00 17.00 Cds $425.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 51.50 1438.00 Cds $74,057.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 51.50 9.00 Cds $463.50
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 25.00 3.00 Cds $75.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 25.00 16.00 Cds $400.00

$119,726.50  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 26.38 28.50 901.00 Cds $25,678.50

BALSAM FIR 8.80 10.00 42.00 Cds $420.00
BIRCH 7.03 8.00 98.00 Cds $784.00

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 6.00 49.00 Cds $294.00

PINE-JACK 16.14 17.00 17.00 Cds $289.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 30.50 1438.00 Cds $43,859.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 29.00 9.00 Cds $261.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 17.00 3.00 Cds $51.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 17.00 16.00 Cds $272.00

$71,933.50  

Tract 
13

C19240013

Island Lake Logging
ASH 5.00 15.00 12.00 Cds $180.00

ASPEN 26.38 49.00 922.00 Cds $45,178.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 11.00 Cds $110.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 68.00 Cds $1,020.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 15.00 98.00 Cds $1,470.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 25.00 69.00 Cds $1,725.00

$49,683.00 *Winner*

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
ASH 5.00 5.00 12.00 Cds $60.00

ASPEN 26.38 38.00 922.00 Cds $35,036.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 11.00 Cds $55.00

BIRCH 7.03 8.00 68.00 Cds $544.00
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 7.00 98.00 Cds $686.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 10.00 69.00 Cds $690.00

$37,071.00  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASH 5.00 5.00 12.00 Cds $60.00

ASPEN 26.38 34.55 922.00 Cds $31,855.10
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 11.00 Cds $55.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 68.00 Cds $478.04
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 98.00 Cds $668.36
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 69.00 Cds $345.00

$33,461.50  

Tract 
14

C19240014

Tristate Logging
ASH 1.00 1.00 36.00 Cds $36.00

ASPEN 5.00 10.00 1131.00 Cds $11,310.00
BALSAM FIR 1.00 1.00 217.00 Cds $217.00

BIRCH 1.00 1.00 831.00 Cds $831.00
MAPLE-RED 1.00 1.00 189.00 Cds $189.00

PINE-JACK 5.00 5.00 184.00 Cds $920.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 5.00 5.00 377.00 Cds $1,885.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 210.00 Cds $1,050.00

TAMARACK 1.00 1.00 98.00 Cds $98.00
$16,536.00 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
16

C19240016

Tristate Logging
ASPEN 10.00 10.00 425.00 Cds $4,250.00

BALSAM FIR 1.00 1.00 53.00 Cds $53.00
BIRCH 1.00 1.00 98.00 Cds $98.00

MAPLE-RED 1.00 1.00 6.00 Cds $6.00
PINE-JACK 1.00 1.00 8.00 Cds $8.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 1.00 10.00 475.00 Cds $4,750.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 1.00 1.00 56.00 Cds $56.00

TAMARACK 1.00 1.00 77.00 Cds $77.00
$9,298.00 *Winner*

Tract 
17

C19240017

Tristate Logging
ASH 1.00 1.00 1.00 Cds $1.00

ASPEN 1.00 2.00 85.00 Cds $170.00
BALSAM FIR 1.00 1.00 88.00 Cds $88.00

BIRCH 1.00 1.00 103.00 Cds $103.00
MAPLE-RED 1.00 1.00 8.00 Cds $8.00

PINE-JACK 1.00 1.00 18.00 Cds $18.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 1.00 1.00 68.00 Cds $68.00

TAMARACK 1.00 1.00 10.00 Cds $10.00
$466.00 *Winner*

Tract 
18

C19240018

Nels Kimball
ASPEN 10.00 12.00 583.00 Cds $6,996.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 97.00 Cds $485.00
BIRCH 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

PINE-JACK 5.00 5.00 89.00 Cds $445.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 5.00 5.00 671.00 Cds $3,355.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

TAMARACK 3.84 3.84 165.00 Cds $633.60
$12,114.60 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tristate Logging
ASPEN 10.00 10.00 583.00 Cds $5,830.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 97.00 Cds $485.00
BIRCH 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

PINE-JACK 5.00 5.00 89.00 Cds $445.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 5.00 5.00 671.00 Cds $3,355.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

TAMARACK 3.84 5.00 165.00 Cds $825.00
$11,140.00  

Tract 
19

C19240019

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 26.38 34.10 1378.00 Cds $46,989.80

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 34.10 4.00 Cds $136.40
BALSAM FIR 5.00 6.00 21.00 Cds $126.00

BIRCH 7.03 8.00 21.00 Cds $168.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 6.00 41.00 Cds $246.00

PINE-JACK 16.14 17.00 6.00 Cds $102.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 26.00 Cds $390.00

$48,158.20 *Winner*

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN 26.38 31.00 1378.00 Cds $42,718.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 31.00 4.00 Cds $124.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 21.00 Cds $105.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 21.00 Cds $147.63
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 41.00 Cds $205.41

PINE-JACK 16.14 16.14 6.00 Cds $96.84
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 26.00 Cds $384.54

$43,781.42  

Nels Kimball
ASPEN 26.38 30.00 1378.00 Cds $41,340.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 23.67 4.00 Cds $94.68
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 21.00 Cds $105.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 21.00 Cds $147.63
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 41.00 Cds $205.41

PINE-JACK 16.14 16.14 6.00 Cds $96.84



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 26.00 Cds $384.54
$42,374.10  

Tract 
20

C19240020

Tristate Logging
PINE-NORWAY 26.25 35.00 72.00 Cds $2,520.00

$2,520.00 *Winner*

Bell Timber, Inc.
PINE-NORWAY 26.25 26.52 72.00 Cds $1,909.44

$1,909.44  

Northwoods Timber Harvesting
PINE-NORWAY 26.25 32.00 72.00 Cds $2,304.00

$2,304.00  

Tract 
21

C19240021

Watters Excavating 
ASH 5.00 15.00 302.00 Cds $4,530.00

ASPEN 26.38 51.00 874.00 Cds $44,574.00
BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 51.00 5.00 Cds $255.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 34.00 Cds $340.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 38.00 Cds $570.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 25.00 9.00 Cds $225.00
$50,494.00 *Winner*

Island Lake Logging
ASH 5.00 15.00 302.00 Cds $4,530.00

ASPEN 26.38 48.00 874.00 Cds $41,952.00
BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 48.00 5.00 Cds $240.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 34.00 Cds $170.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 38.00 Cds $570.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 20.00 9.00 Cds $180.00
$47,642.00  

Nels Kimball
ASH 5.00 5.00 302.00 Cds $1,510.00

ASPEN 26.38 30.00 874.00 Cds $26,220.00
BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 23.67 5.00 Cds $118.35



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 34.00 Cds $170.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 38.00 Cds $267.14

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 9.00 Cds $133.11
$28,418.60  

Sappi Fine Paper
ASH 5.00 26.38 302.00 Cds $7,966.76

ASPEN 26.38 26.38 874.00 Cds $23,056.12
BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 26.38 5.00 Cds $131.90

BALSAM FIR 5.00 26.38 34.00 Cds $896.92
BIRCH 7.03 26.38 38.00 Cds $1,002.44

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 26.38 9.00 Cds $237.42
$33,291.56  

Tristate Logging
ASH 5.00 5.00 302.00 Cds $1,510.00

ASPEN 26.38 50.00 874.00 Cds $43,700.00
BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 50.00 5.00 Cds $250.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 34.00 Cds $340.00
BIRCH 7.03 10.00 38.00 Cds $380.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 9.00 Cds $135.00
$46,315.00  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASH 5.00 5.00 302.00 Cds $1,510.00

ASPEN 26.38 37.19 874.00 Cds $32,504.06
BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 37.19 5.00 Cds $185.95

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 34.00 Cds $170.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 38.00 Cds $267.14

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 9.00 Cds $133.11
$34,770.26  

Tract 
22

C19240022

Watters Excavating 
ASPEN 26.38 54.50 997.00 Cds $54,336.50

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 54.50 17.00 Cds $926.50
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 110.00 Cds $1,100.00

BIRCH 7.03 15.00 106.00 Cds $1,590.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 45.00 Cds $675.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 15.00 4.00 Cds $60.00
$58,688.00 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 26.38 40.00 997.00 Cds $39,880.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 40.00 17.00 Cds $680.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 110.00 Cds $550.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.50 106.00 Cds $795.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 7.50 45.00 Cds $337.50

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 7.50 4.00 Cds $30.00
$42,272.50  

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 26.38 41.00 997.00 Cds $40,877.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 41.00 17.00 Cds $697.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 110.00 Cds $1,100.00

BIRCH 7.03 15.00 106.00 Cds $1,590.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 45.00 Cds $675.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 15.00 4.00 Cds $60.00
$44,999.00  

Nels Kimball
ASPEN 26.38 30.00 997.00 Cds $29,910.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 30.00 17.00 Cds $510.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 110.00 Cds $550.00

BIRCH 7.03 8.00 106.00 Cds $848.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 45.00 Cds $225.45

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 4.00 Cds $27.28
$32,070.73  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 26.38 37.19 997.00 Cds $37,078.43

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 35.00 17.00 Cds $595.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 110.00 Cds $550.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 106.00 Cds $745.18
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 45.00 Cds $225.45

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 4.00 Cds $27.28
$39,221.34  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
23

C19240023

Watters Excavating 
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 2.00 Cds $20.00

BIRCH 7.03 15.00 4.00 Cds $60.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 65.00 550.00 Cds $35,750.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 61.50 460.00 Cds $28,290.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 25.00 2.00 Cds $50.00

$64,170.00 *Winner*

Bell Timber, Inc.
BALSAM FIR 5.00 7.55 2.00 Cds $15.10

BIRCH 7.03 10.62 4.00 Cds $42.48
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 44.03 550.00 Cds $24,216.50

PINE-WHITE 28.10 42.43 460.00 Cds $19,517.80
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 7.55 2.00 Cds $15.10

$43,806.98  

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 4.00 Cds $28.12
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 32.66 550.00 Cds $17,963.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 31.47 460.00 Cds $14,476.20
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

$32,487.32  

Hull Forest Products
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 4.00 Cds $28.12
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 45.00 550.00 Cds $24,750.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 45.00 460.00 Cds $20,700.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

$45,498.12  

Island Lake Logging
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 2.00 Cds $20.00

BIRCH 7.03 10.00 4.00 Cds $40.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 51.50 550.00 Cds $28,325.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 51.50 460.00 Cds $23,690.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 10.00 2.00 Cds $20.00

$52,095.00  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Jatco Inc.
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 4.00 Cds $28.12
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 51.50 550.00 Cds $28,325.00

PINE-WHITE 28.10 41.25 460.00 Cds $18,975.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

$47,348.12  

Tract 
24

C19240024

Watters Excavating 
ASPEN 26.38 48.50 704.00 Cds $34,144.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 48.50 55.00 Cds $2,667.50
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 363.00 Cds $5,445.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 10.00 25.00 60.00 Cds $1,500.00
$43,756.50 *Winner*

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
ASPEN 26.38 38.00 704.00 Cds $26,752.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 7.03 8.00 363.00 Cds $2,904.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 10.00 10.00 60.00 Cds $600.00
$30,531.00  

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 26.38 29.00 704.00 Cds $20,416.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 7.03 10.00 363.00 Cds $3,630.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 10.00 15.00 60.00 Cds $900.00
$25,221.00  

Tristate Logging
ASPEN 26.38 35.00 704.00 Cds $24,640.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 7.03 10.00 363.00 Cds $3,630.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 10.00 10.00 60.00 Cds $600.00
$29,145.00  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
25

C19240025

Watters Excavating 
ASPEN 26.38 65.50 1423.00 Cds $93,206.50

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 65.50 3.00 Cds $196.50
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 20.00 Cds $200.00

BIRCH 7.03 15.00 161.00 Cds $2,415.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 30.00 12.00 Cds $360.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 25.00 9.00 Cds $225.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 25.00 101.00 Cds $2,525.00

$99,128.00 *Winner*

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
ASPEN 26.38 41.00 1423.00 Cds $58,343.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 24.00 3.00 Cds $72.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

BIRCH 7.03 8.00 161.00 Cds $1,288.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 30.00 12.00 Cds $360.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 17.00 9.00 Cds $153.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 17.00 101.00 Cds $1,717.00

$62,033.00  

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 26.38 40.00 1423.00 Cds $56,920.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 40.00 3.00 Cds $120.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 6.00 20.00 Cds $120.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.50 161.00 Cds $1,207.50
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 30.00 12.00 Cds $360.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 17.00 9.00 Cds $153.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 101.00 Cds $1,515.00

$60,395.50  

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 26.38 60.50 1423.00 Cds $86,091.50

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 60.50 3.00 Cds $181.50
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 20.00 Cds $200.00

BIRCH 7.03 15.00 161.00 Cds $2,415.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 40.00 12.00 Cds $480.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 20.00 9.00 Cds $180.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 30.00 101.00 Cds $3,030.00
$92,578.00  

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN 26.38 54.00 1423.00 Cds $76,842.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 54.00 3.00 Cds $162.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 161.00 Cds $1,131.83
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 29.16 12.00 Cds $349.92
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 17.00 9.00 Cds $153.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 17.00 101.00 Cds $1,717.00

$80,455.75  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 26.38 30.00 1423.00 Cds $42,690.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 30.00 3.00 Cds $90.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

BIRCH 7.03 8.00 161.00 Cds $1,288.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 30.00 12.00 Cds $360.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 16.50 9.00 Cds $148.50
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 16.50 101.00 Cds $1,666.50

$46,343.00  

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN 26.38 47.00 1423.00 Cds $66,881.00

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 47.00 3.00 Cds $141.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 47.00 20.00 Cds $940.00

BIRCH 7.03 47.00 161.00 Cds $7,567.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 47.00 12.00 Cds $564.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 47.00 9.00 Cds $423.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 47.00 101.00 Cds $4,747.00

$81,263.00  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 26.38 37.38 1423.00 Cds $53,191.74

BALM OF GILEAD 23.67 34.38 3.00 Cds $103.14
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 20.00 Cds $100.00

BIRCH 7.03 7.03 161.00 Cds $1,131.83
PINE-NORWAY 29.16 29.16 12.00 Cds $349.92
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.42 16.42 9.00 Cds $147.78



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 101.00 Cds $1,493.79
$56,518.20  

Tract 
28

C19240028

Watters Excavating 
ASH 5.00 15.00 47.00 Cds $705.00

ASPEN 26.38 61.50 2784.00 Cds $171,216.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 113.00 Cds $1,130.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 38.00 Cds $570.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 15.00 350.00 Cds $5,250.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 25.00 43.00 Cds $1,075.00

$179,946.00 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation
ASH 5.00 7.00 47.00 Cds $329.00

ASPEN 26.38 40.00 2784.00 Cds $111,360.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 7.00 113.00 Cds $791.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 9.00 38.00 Cds $342.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 9.00 350.00 Cds $3,150.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 43.00 Cds $645.00

$116,617.00  

Island Lake Logging
ASH 5.00 15.00 47.00 Cds $705.00

ASPEN 26.38 51.50 2784.00 Cds $143,376.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 113.00 Cds $1,130.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 38.00 Cds $570.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 15.00 350.00 Cds $5,250.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 30.00 43.00 Cds $1,290.00

$152,321.00  

Jatco Inc.
ASH 5.00 5.00 47.00 Cds $235.00

ASPEN 26.38 42.75 2784.00 Cds $119,016.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 113.00 Cds $565.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 38.00 Cds $190.38

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 350.00 Cds $2,387.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 43.00 Cds $635.97

$123,029.35  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Sappi Fine Paper
ASH 5.00 45.00 47.00 Cds $2,115.00

ASPEN 26.38 45.00 2784.00 Cds $125,280.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 45.00 113.00 Cds $5,085.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 45.00 38.00 Cds $1,710.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 45.00 350.00 Cds $15,750.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 45.00 43.00 Cds $1,935.00

$151,875.00  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASH 5.00 5.00 47.00 Cds $235.00

ASPEN 26.38 34.00 2784.00 Cds $94,656.00
BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 113.00 Cds $565.00
MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 38.00 Cds $190.38

MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 350.00 Cds $2,387.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 43.00 Cds $635.97

$98,669.35  

Tract 
29

C19240029

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 29.02 45.00 1572.00 Cds $70,740.00

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 29.02 45.00 23.00 Cds $1,035.00
BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 45.00 26.00 Cds $1,170.00

BIRCH 7.74 9.00 35.00 Cds $315.00
$73,260.00 *Winner*

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 29.02 41.50 1572.00 Cds $65,238.00

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 29.02 41.50 23.00 Cds $954.50
BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 41.50 26.00 Cds $1,079.00

BIRCH 7.74 15.00 35.00 Cds $525.00
$67,796.50  

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN 29.02 41.40 1572.00 Cds $65,080.80

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 29.02 41.40 23.00 Cds $952.20
BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 41.40 26.00 Cds $1,076.40

BIRCH 7.74 41.40 35.00 Cds $1,449.00
$68,558.40  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

UPM Blandin Forestry
ASPEN 29.02 44.40 1572.00 Cds $69,796.80

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 29.02 44.40 23.00 Cds $1,021.20
BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 40.01 26.00 Cds $1,040.26

BIRCH 7.74 12.00 35.00 Cds $420.00
$72,278.26  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 29.02 34.02 1572.00 Cds $53,479.44

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 29.02 34.02 23.00 Cds $782.46
BALM OF GILEAD 26.03 31.02 26.00 Cds $806.52

BIRCH 7.74 7.74 35.00 Cds $270.90
$55,339.32  

Tract 
30

C19240030

Tristate Logging
ASH 5.00 5.00 423.00 Cds $2,115.00

ASPEN 26.38 30.00 44.00 Cds $1,320.00
BALSAM FIR 8.80 10.00 15.00 Cds $150.00

BIRCH 7.03 10.00 3.00 Cds $30.00
$3,615.00 *Winner*

Tract 
31

C19240031

Watters Excavating 
ASPEN 26.38 51.50 1007.00 Cds $51,860.50

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 7.00 Cds $70.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 13.00 Cds $195.00

MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 20.00 Cds $300.00
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 15.00 1.00 Cds $15.00

$52,440.50 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 26.38 48.00 1007.00 Cds $48,336.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 7.00 7.00 Cds $49.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.50 13.00 Cds $97.50

MAPLE-RED 5.01 7.00 20.00 Cds $140.00
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 7.00 1.00 Cds $7.00

$48,629.50  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 26.38 45.00 1007.00 Cds $45,315.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 7.00 Cds $70.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 13.00 Cds $195.00

MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 20.00 Cds $300.00
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 15.00 1.00 Cds $15.00

$45,895.00  

Nels Kimball
ASPEN 26.38 30.00 1007.00 Cds $30,210.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 7.00 Cds $35.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 13.00 Cds $91.39

MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 20.00 Cds $100.20
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 1.00 Cds $6.82

$30,443.41  

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN 26.38 46.00 1007.00 Cds $46,322.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 7.00 Cds $35.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 13.00 Cds $91.39

MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 20.00 Cds $100.20
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 1.00 Cds $6.82

$46,555.41  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 26.38 31.00 1007.00 Cds $31,217.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 7.00 Cds $35.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 13.00 Cds $91.39

MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 20.00 Cds $100.20
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.82 6.82 1.00 Cds $6.82

$31,450.41  

Tract 
32

C19240032

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 26.38 50.50 375.00 Cds $18,937.50

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 18.00 Cds $180.00
BIRCH 7.03 15.00 22.00 Cds $330.00

MAPLE-RED 5.01 15.00 60.00 Cds $900.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 30.00 8.00 Cds $240.00

$20,587.50 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 26.38 40.00 375.00 Cds $15,000.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 7.00 18.00 Cds $126.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.50 22.00 Cds $165.00

MAPLE-RED 5.01 7.00 60.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 8.00 Cds $120.00

$15,831.00  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 26.38 26.50 375.00 Cds $9,937.50

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 18.00 Cds $90.00
BIRCH 7.03 8.00 22.00 Cds $176.00

MAPLE-RED 5.01 6.00 60.00 Cds $360.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 8.00 Cds $120.00

$10,683.50  

Nels Kimball
ASPEN 26.38 27.00 375.00 Cds $10,125.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 18.00 Cds $90.00
BIRCH 7.03 8.00 22.00 Cds $176.00

MAPLE-RED 5.01 6.00 60.00 Cds $360.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 8.00 Cds $118.32

$10,869.32  

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN 26.38 34.50 375.00 Cds $12,937.50

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 18.00 Cds $90.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 22.00 Cds $154.66

MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 60.00 Cds $300.60
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 8.00 Cds $120.00

$13,602.76  

Tristate Logging
ASPEN 26.38 50.00 375.00 Cds $18,750.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 18.00 Cds $90.00
BIRCH 7.03 10.00 22.00 Cds $220.00

MAPLE-RED 5.01 10.00 60.00 Cds $600.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 15.00 8.00 Cds $120.00

$19,780.00  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 26.38 27.00 375.00 Cds $10,125.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 18.00 Cds $90.00
BIRCH 7.03 7.03 22.00 Cds $154.66

MAPLE-RED 5.01 5.01 60.00 Cds $300.60
SPRUCE-WHITE 14.79 14.79 8.00 Cds $118.32

$10,788.58  

Tract 
33

C19240033

Watters Excavating 
ASPEN 31.66 68.50 3317.00 Cds $227,214.50

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 55.00 Cds $550.00
BIRCH 8.44 15.00 120.00 Cds $1,800.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 50.00 12.00 Cds $600.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 25.00 30.00 Cds $750.00

$230,914.50 *Winner*

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
ASPEN 31.66 44.00 3317.00 Cds $145,948.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 8.44 9.00 120.00 Cds $1,080.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 35.00 12.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 18.00 30.00 Cds $540.00

$148,263.00  

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 31.66 55.00 3317.00 Cds $182,435.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 7.00 55.00 Cds $385.00
BIRCH 8.44 9.00 120.00 Cds $1,080.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 35.00 12.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 18.00 30.00 Cds $540.00

$184,860.00  

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 31.66 61.50 3317.00 Cds $203,995.50

BALSAM FIR 5.00 10.00 55.00 Cds $550.00
BIRCH 8.44 15.00 120.00 Cds $1,800.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 45.00 12.00 Cds $540.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 31.00 30.00 Cds $930.00

$207,815.50  

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN 31.66 61.85 3317.00 Cds $205,156.45



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 8.44 8.44 120.00 Cds $1,012.80

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 35.00 12.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 17.75 30.00 Cds $532.50

$207,396.75  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 31.66 42.00 3317.00 Cds $139,314.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 8.44 9.00 120.00 Cds $1,080.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 35.00 12.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 18.00 30.00 Cds $540.00

$141,629.00  

Nels Kimball
ASPEN 31.66 50.00 3317.00 Cds $165,850.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 8.44 12.00 120.00 Cds $1,440.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 35.00 12.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 17.75 30.00 Cds $532.50

$168,517.50  

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN 31.66 62.10 3317.00 Cds $205,985.70

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 8.44 8.44 120.00 Cds $1,012.80

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 35.00 12.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 35.00 30.00 Cds $1,050.00

$208,743.50  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 31.66 39.73 3317.00 Cds $131,784.41

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 55.00 Cds $275.00
BIRCH 8.44 8.44 120.00 Cds $1,012.80

PINE-NORWAY 35.00 35.00 12.00 Cds $420.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 17.75 17.75 30.00 Cds $532.50

$134,024.71  

Tract 
34

C19240034

Watters Excavating 
ASPEN 29.02 52.50 650.00 Cds $34,125.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 9.68 10.00 127.00 Cds $1,270.00
BIRCH 7.74 15.00 35.00 Cds $525.00

PINE-JACK 17.75 20.00 2.00 Cds $40.00
PINE-NORWAY 32.08 60.00 446.00 Cds $26,760.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 25.00 130.00 Cds $3,250.00

TAMARACK 3.51 8.00 26.00 Cds $208.00
$66,178.00 *Winner*

Bell Timber, Inc.
ASPEN 29.02 38.02 650.00 Cds $24,713.00

BALSAM FIR 9.68 12.68 127.00 Cds $1,610.36
BIRCH 7.74 7.74 35.00 Cds $270.90

PINE-JACK 17.75 23.25 2.00 Cds $46.50
PINE-NORWAY 32.08 42.02 446.00 Cds $18,740.92
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 21.31 130.00 Cds $2,770.30

TAMARACK 3.51 4.60 26.00 Cds $119.60
$48,271.58  

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN 29.02 40.00 650.00 Cds $26,000.00

BALSAM FIR 9.68 10.00 127.00 Cds $1,270.00
BIRCH 7.74 8.00 35.00 Cds $280.00

PINE-JACK 17.75 17.75 2.00 Cds $35.50
PINE-NORWAY 32.08 33.00 446.00 Cds $14,718.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 25.00 130.00 Cds $3,250.00

TAMARACK 3.51 4.00 26.00 Cds $104.00
$45,657.50  

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN 29.02 45.00 650.00 Cds $29,250.00

BALSAM FIR 9.68 15.00 127.00 Cds $1,905.00
BIRCH 7.74 15.00 35.00 Cds $525.00

PINE-JACK 17.75 35.00 2.00 Cds $70.00
PINE-NORWAY 32.08 51.50 446.00 Cds $22,969.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 25.00 130.00 Cds $3,250.00

TAMARACK 3.51 10.00 26.00 Cds $260.00
$58,229.00  

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN 29.02 44.90 650.00 Cds $29,185.00

BALSAM FIR 9.68 9.68 127.00 Cds $1,229.36
BIRCH 7.74 7.74 35.00 Cds $270.90



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

PINE-JACK 17.75 17.75 2.00 Cds $35.50
PINE-NORWAY 32.08 48.50 446.00 Cds $21,631.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 17.00 130.00 Cds $2,210.00

TAMARACK 3.51 3.51 26.00 Cds $91.26
$54,653.02  

Waste Wood Recyclers
ASPEN 29.02 33.50 650.00 Cds $21,775.00

BALSAM FIR 9.68 9.68 127.00 Cds $1,229.36
BIRCH 7.74 7.74 35.00 Cds $270.90

PINE-JACK 17.75 17.75 2.00 Cds $35.50
PINE-NORWAY 32.08 35.00 446.00 Cds $15,610.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.27 16.27 130.00 Cds $2,115.10

TAMARACK 3.51 3.51 26.00 Cds $91.26
$41,127.12  

Tract 
35

C19240035

Tristate Logging
ASPEN 23.74 25.00 21.00 Cds $525.00

BALSAM FIR 1.00 1.00 56.00 Cds $56.00
BIRCH 6.33 7.00 20.00 Cds $140.00

MIXED PINE 5.00 10.00 204.00 Cds $2,040.00
PINE-JACK 9.70 20.00 453.00 Cds $9,060.00

PINE-NORWAY 26.25 30.00 358.00 Cds $10,740.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 13.31 15.00 20.00 Cds $300.00

$22,861.00 *Winner*

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 23.74 23.75 21.00 Cds $498.75

BALSAM FIR 1.00 1.00 56.00 Cds $56.00
BIRCH 6.33 6.50 20.00 Cds $130.00

MIXED PINE 5.00 5.25 204.00 Cds $1,071.00
PINE-JACK 9.70 9.75 453.00 Cds $4,416.75

PINE-NORWAY 26.25 26.50 358.00 Cds $9,487.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 13.31 13.50 20.00 Cds $270.00

$15,929.50  



PIKE LAKE AREA
Appraised

Volume Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Apprased Total Sold

ASH 772 772 $5.00 $9.52 $3,860.00 $7,350.00
ASPEN 13,771 13,747 $28.04 $58.32 $386,145.70 $801,674.50
ASPEN-
LARGETOOTH

23 23 $29.02 $45.00 $667.46 $1,035.00

BALM OF GILEAD 51 51 $24.87 $49.96 $1,268.53 $2,548.00
BALSAM FIR 607 556 $6.07 $13.81 $3,686.36 $7,677.50
BIRCH 900 900 $7.27 $14.75 $6,545.90 $13,275.00
MAPLE-RED 163 163 $5.01 $15.00 $816.63 $2,445.00
MAPLE-SUGAR 355 355 $6.82 $15.00 $2,421.10 $5,325.00
PINE-JACK 2 2 $17.75 $20.00 $35.50 $40.00
PINE-NORWAY 1,464 1,020 $22.77 $62.23 $33,335.60 $63,470.00
PINE-WHITE 466 460 $27.80 $61.50 $12,956.00 $28,290.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 9 9 $16.42 $25.00 $147.78 $225.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 408 383 $14.13 $25.10 $5,763.79 $9,615.00
TAMARACK 26 26 $3.51 $8.00 $91.26 $208.00

Totals 19,017 18,467 $457,741.61 $943,178.00

Feb, 15, 2024 Timber Auction Results



VIRGINIA AREA
Appraised

Volume Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Apprased Total Sold

ASH 117 117 $4.05 $5.07 $473.50 $593.50
ASPEN 14,256 13,415 $24.37 $36.85 $347,363.55 $494,360.74
BALM OF GILEAD 37 37 $24.82 $33.37 $918.27 $1,234.85
BALSAM FIR 1,791 1,662 $6.90 $8.23 $12,355.62 $13,672.64
BIRCH 2,555 2,112 $4.72 $6.45 $12,056.26 $13,626.34
CEDAR-N.WHITE 5 5 $5.00 $5.00 $25.00 $25.00
MAPLE-RED 885 864 $4.29 $5.90 $3,793.57 $5,100.97
MAPLE-SUGAR 141 141 $7.03 $12.72 $991.29 $1,792.93
MIXED PINE 204 204 $5.00 $10.00 $1,020.00 $2,040.00
PINE-JACK 1,236 1,076 $9.83 $18.49 $12,144.06 $19,900.36
PINE-NORWAY 3,717 2,210 $21.66 $47.66 $80,520.44 $105,322.68
PINE-WHITE 1,094 1,089 $33.54 $43.60 $36,693.80 $47,481.30
SPRUCE-BLACK 1,780 1,766 $5.06 $7.60 $8,997.90 $13,424.72
SPRUCE-WHITE 1,161 1,118 $11.75 $19.08 $13,639.36 $21,327.16
TAMARACK 359 354 $2.36 $2.37 $845.69 $838.60

Totals 29,338 26,170 $531,838.31 $740,741.79



Total County
Appraised

Volume Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Apprased Total Sold

ASH 889 889 $4.87 $8.94 $4,333.50 $7,943.50
ASPEN 28,027 27,162 $26.17 $47.72 $733,509.25 $1,296,035.24
ASPEN-
LARGETOOTH

23 23 $29.02 $45.00 $667.46 $1,035.00

BALM OF GILEAD 88 88 $24.85 $42.99 $2,186.80 $3,782.85
BALSAM FIR 2,398 2,218 $6.69 $9.63 $16,041.98 $21,350.14
BIRCH 3,455 3,012 $5.38 $8.93 $18,602.16 $26,901.34
CEDAR-N.WHITE 5 5 $5.00 $5.00 $25.00 $25.00
MAPLE-RED 1,048 1,027 $4.40 $7.35 $4,610.20 $7,545.97
MAPLE-SUGAR 496 496 $6.88 $14.35 $3,412.39 $7,117.93
MIXED PINE 204 204 $5.00 $10.00 $1,020.00 $2,040.00
PINE-JACK 1,238 1,078 $9.84 $18.50 $12,179.56 $19,940.36
PINE-NORWAY 5,181 3,230 $21.98 $52.26 $113,856.04 $168,792.68
PINE-WHITE 1,560 1,549 $31.83 $48.92 $49,649.80 $75,771.30
SPRUCE-BLACK 1,789 1,775 $5.11 $7.69 $9,145.68 $13,649.72
SPRUCE-WHITE 1,569 1,501 $12.37 $20.61 $19,403.15 $30,942.16
TAMARACK 385 380 $2.43 $2.75 $936.95 $1,046.60

Totals 48,355 44,637 $989,579.92 $1,683,919.79
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