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1 D22240001 130054  Cheryl Templer $15,600.00 $15,600.00 

2 D22240003 130533  Frank Talarico $15,600.00 $20,614.00

3 D22240002 125324  NO BID $40,600.00 -

4  D22240004 122746 NO BID $9,200.00 - 

5 D22240009 123597 NO BID $8,000.00 - 

6 D22240005 125331 NO BID $38,500.00 - 

7 D22240006 125334 NO BID $15,900.00 - 

8 D22240007 125335 NO BID $11,900.00 - 

9 D22240008 123603 NO BID $111,000.00 - 

10 D22240010 130018 Deborah J. Freedman, One Roof Community 
Housing Inc. 

$9,000.00 $9,200.00 

11 D22240011 122763 NO BID $17,300.00 - 

12 D22240012 125392 NO BID $8,200.00 - 

13 D22240013 130009; 125393 NO BID $15,500.00 - 

14 D22240014 130034 Vernis E. Ziegelmann $108,800.00 $147,100.00 

15 D22240015 130033 Richard W. Blake $12,700.00 $12,900.00 

16 D22240016 122777 NO BID $8,600.00 -
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17 D22240017 130440 Joel Musburger $2,300.00 $2,300.00 

18 D22240018 130164 NO BID $4,400.00 - 

19 D22240019 125434 NO BID $73,300.00 - 

20 D22240020 130625 NO BID $8,900.00 - 

21 D22240021 130158 NO BID $31,200.00 - 

22 D22240022 124090 Haze Ventures, Inc. $500.00 $6,500.00 

23 D22240023 130450; 130451 NO BID $3,800.00 - 

24 D22240024 125439 Korrin Dean $2,500.00 $3,050.00 

25 D22240025 130064 Herbert Hawkson $2,500.00 $3,050.00 

26 D22240026 125440 Barb Higgins $4,300.00 $4,300.00 

27 D22240027 125441 NO BID $2,500.00 - 

28 D22240028 125442 NO BID $5,800.00 - 

29 D22240030 130452 Joan V. Kaurala $2,700.00 $3,250.00 

30 D22240029 130633 Patricia LG Thornton $3,600.00 $5,200.00 

31 D22240031 130203 NO BID $4,700.00 - 

32 D22240032 130540 Travis J. Peterson, Vertex Roofing Inc. $37,600.00 $70,200.00 
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33 D22240033 130453 NO BID $52,300.00 - 

34 D22240034 
130457 

NO BID $54,400.00 - 

35 D22240035 130465 NO BID $4,900.00 - 

36 D22240036 130466 NO BID $4,900.00 - 

37 D22240037 130467 NO BID $108,900.00 - 

38 D22240038 130469 NO BID $99,800.00 - 

39 D22240039 123695 Eric L. Udelhoven $3,200.00 $3,200.00 

40 D22240040 130196 NO BID $13,700.00 - 

41 D22240041 130217; 130218 NO BID $7,200.00 - 

42 D22240042 130194 Maria K. Manner $12,900.00 $12,900.00 

43 D22240043 130642 NO BID $3,000.00 - 

44 D22240045 125456 NO BID $6,600.00 - 

45 D22240046 130644 Herbert Hawkson $2,700.00 $2,700.00 

46 D22240047 130193; 130191 NO BID $19,500.00 - 

47 D22240048 130474 NO BID $32,900.00 - 

48 D22240049 125146; 125147; 125148 NO BID $11,500.00 -
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49 D22240050 125464 NO BID $6,600.00 - 

50 D22240051 125149; 125150 NO BID $10,400.00 - 

51 D22240052 122811 NO BID $42,900.00 - 

52 D22240053 130729 NO BID $11,000.00 - 

53 D22240054 130478 Adam Venne $21,800.00 $21,800.00 

54 D22240055 130646 NO BID $101,300.00 - 

55 D22240056 123705 Wesley W. Anderson $4,800.00 $4,800.00 

56 D22240057 130649 NO BID $12,800.00 - 

57 D22240058 125470; 125471 NO BID $21,100.00 - 

58 D22240059 130652 Betsy Olivanti, City of Hibbing $26,900.00 $26,900.00 

 59 D22240060 130484; 130485 NO BID $17,700.00 -

 60 D22240061 130486 NO BID $35,900.00 -

 61 D22240062 123216 NO BID  $5,400.00 -

 62 D22240063 130493 Amber M. Kough  $8,200.00 $8,200.00

 63 D22240064 123225 NO BID $19,200.00 -

 64 D22240065 123231 NO BID $72,600.00 -
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 65 D22240066 125485 David P. Cook, JCA Environmental $23,900.00 $23,900.00

 66 D22240067 125488 NO BID $23,600.00 -

 67 D22240068 130504 Daniel R. Allard $33,300.00 $74,600.00

 68 D22240069 123263 John Rodorigo $53,600.00 $53,600.00

 69 D22240070 123755 Roy Marlow $1,900.00 $13,400.00

 70 D22240071 130680 Mike Koepke $100.00 $203.50

 71 D22240072 130681 Colin D. Ulmer $400.00 $3,125.00

 72 D22240073 130682 Noha Reda $400.00 $1,575.00

 73 D22240074 130508 Haze Ventures, Inc. $400.00 $1,525.00

 74 D22240075 125495 Whitney Kolquist, Jackson Hermantown, 
LLC 

$92,900.00 $92,900.00

 75 D22240076 123764 NO BID $59,200.00 -

 76 D22240077 130694 Gerry L. Weber $4,400.00 $4,500.00

 77 D22240078 123776 NO BID $25,100.00 -

 78 D22240079 130513 Rodney L. Alto $25,000.00 $25,000.00

 79 D22240080 130703 NO BID $44,200.00 -

 80 D22240081 130704 NO BID $57,800.00 -

 81 D22240082 130516 NO BID $19,600.00 -
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 82 D22240083 130710 NO BID $157,200.00 -

 83 D22240084 125515 NO BID $11,100.00 -

 84 D22240085 130132 NO BID $26,900.00 -

 85 D22240086 123809 NO BID $38,900.00 -

 86 D22240087 130723 Herbert Hawkson $200.00 $2,225.00

 87 D22240088 130067 NO BID $40,300.00 -

Total Tracts 87 Total Value $2,234,400.00 

Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00 

Net Total Tracts 87 Net Total Value $2,234,400.00 $680,317.50 

Total Tracts Sold 32 

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 36.78% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 30.45% 




