August 2024 - REGULAR - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic SalePrice  Sale Amount
1 c2zz20668  o0ooe 00223100229 payig sindberg, Festes, Inc. $15700.00  $15700.00
2 Co2220660  oooorioooe P29 Nicholas's. Olson $17,96500  $17,965.00
3 C22220675 117822 NO BID $16,700.00 -
4  C22220677 101668 David Sundberg, Festies, Inc. $22,950.00 $46,000.00
5 C22200183 104236 Dustin Follett $18,495.00 $32,100.00
6 (C22220682 105021118199 Daniel C. Harman, Morning Wood Logging $4,725.00 $5,100.00
7 C22210217 105294 NO BID $11,580.00 -
8 (C22220621 130268;130269 Michael S. Engh $21,200.00 $21,200.00
9 (C22220689 105445;105448 Nicholas S. Olson $3,975.00 $3,975.00
10 C22200130 105812 NO BID $16,720.00 -
11 C22220573 106047 NO BID $5,300.00 -
12 C22220690 122066;122067 PULLED $13,275.00 -
13 C22220691 117258;122069 PULLED $14,175.00 -
14 C22220692 122068 PULLED $18,900.00 -
15 C22180160 117261 NO BID $6,321.35 -
16 C22220626 106409 NO BID $6,300.00 -
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17  C22220628 106411 NO BID $5,100.00 -
18 C22220693 122081 Dustin Follett $4,950.00 $7,100.00
19 C22200193 122963 NO BID $34,200.00 -
20 C22200195 122490 NO BID $40,090.00 -
21 C22200198 122973 NO BID $37,530.00 -
22 C22200200 122976 Jennifer L. Schindeldecker $34,830.00 $34,830.00
23 C22210042 122623 NO BID $42,940.00 -
24 C22210044 122627 NO BID $28,790.00 -
25 (C22210045 122628 NO BID $35,150.00 -
26 C22210047 122635 NO BID $41,220.00 -
27 C22220631 122636 NO BID $47,500.00 -
28 C22210049 122360 NO BID $84,360.00 -
29 (C22210050 122357 NO BID $73,625.00 -
30 C22210194 122431 NO BID $40,850.00 -
31 C22220632 122432 NO BID $41,250.00 -
32 C22210196 122510 Laura Brambilla $28,500.00 $28,500.00
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33 C22210054 107960;107961;107962 NO BID $86,310.00 -
34 C22210173 3%%;21%%%3;107974;1 NO BID $39,999.00 .
35 C22210059 107977;107978 NO BID $9,560.00 -
36 C22200141 108339 NO BID $16,940.00 -
37 C22220636 108532 NO BID $19,200.00 -
38 C22200205 122264 NO BID $92,440.00 -
39 (C22210199 109289 NO BID $113,480.00 -
40 C22200111 109785 NO BID $13,125.00 -
41 C22210147 109839 NO BID $40,250.00 -
42  C22210222 110154 Robert K. Olson $34,695.00 $34,695.00
43 C22210149 110226 Nicholas S. Olson $6,700.00 $6,700.00
44 C22210068 110503 NO BID $20,060.00 -
45 (C22220574 110541 NO BID $46,800.00 -
46 C22220638 123061 NO BID $26,175.00 -
47  C22210154 111616 Norm Lindsey, Linden Grove Pioneer LLC $37,090.00 $45,100.00
483 C22200220 122600 NO BID $110,650.00 -
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49 (C22220641 112504 NO BID $107,600.00 -
50 (22220642 112505 NOBID $64,200.00 -
51 C22220643 112506 NO BID $53,500.00 -
52  C22220707 112651 NO BID $28,350.00 -
53 (22220708 112884 NOBID $36,400.00 -
54 C22210161 113708 NO BID $26,890.00 -
55 (22210166 115594 NOBID $55,600.00 -
56 22220576 115873 NOBID $6,480.00 -
57 C22210169 116301 NO BID $47,450.00 -
58 C22210170 116317 NO BID $26,890.00 -

Total Tracts 58 Total Value  $2,002,000.35

Pulled Tracts 3 Pulled TractsValue $46,350.00

Net Total Tracts 55 Net Total Value  $1,955,650.35 $298,965.00

Total Tracts Sold 13

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 23.64% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 15.29%
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